
 

 
 
 
DATE:  BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
June 6, 2016                Classroom and Office Supplies, #162005 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 
 

An annual purchasing agreement to provide classroom and office supplies (one hundred thirty-five 
(135) items bid; one hundred thirty-one (131) items awarded) to be stocked and distributed by the 
Central Warehouse.  Items will be purchased on an as needed basis, to replenish the Central 
Warehouse inventory.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

 Central Warehouse 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:      ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
 

AFP Industries, Miami, FL    1                $      700.00 
Gulf Coast Office Products, Pensacola, FL        37               36,500.00 
National Art & School Supplies, Rahway, NJ  6  LLLlLLllL            5,100.00 
Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL             43                                             48,000.00 
School Specialty, Greenville, WI             17       5,900.00 
Standard Stationery Supply, Wheeling, IL          27                                               7,600.00 

 
 
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 
  

$103,800.00 Est. / Yr.           General Fund (1110)  
       

   
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

 ECSD Bid             Responses Received:  7       
      

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

     June 6, 2016, 4:45 pm Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 
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** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.47 $1.47 MD $1.53 $1.53 MD $2.63 $2.63 MD $1.03 $1.03 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.40 $1.40 $1.65 $1.65 $2.87 $2.87 $1.05 $1.05
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $1.59 $1.59 $1.79 $1.79 $2.89 $2.89 $1.05 $1.05
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office $1.40 $1.40  MD, FC $1.70 $1.70 FC $2.96 $2.96 FC $1.04 $1.04  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $1.46 $1.53 MD $1.52 $1.60 MD $2.61 $2.74 MD $1.00 $1.05 ANS, MD

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.82 $1.82 MD $2.12 $2.12 MD $2.90 $2.90 MD 1.25/1.02 1.25/1.02 MD/A,NS

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.54 $1.54 $1.78 $1.78 $2.55 $2.55 $1.05 $1.05
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $1.56 $1.56 $1.56 $1.56 $2.79 $2.79 $2.79 $2.79 A,NS

O School Specialty 5% No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.56 $1.64 A,NS

F Smith Office $1.53 $1.53  MD, FC $1.80 $1.80  MD, FC $2.60 $2.60 FC $1.07 $1.07 FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $1.29 $1.35 MD $1.47 $1.54 MD $2.53 $2.66 ANS, MD $1.00 $1.05 A,NS, MD

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.28 $0.28 MD $5.97 $5.97 MD $4.39 $4.39 MD $6.29 $6.29 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.30 $0.30 $4.73 $4.73 $4.25 $4.25 $6.44 $6.44
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.25 $0.25 $6.09 $6.09 $3.29 $3.29 $4.80 $4.80
O School Specialty 5% $0.24 $0.25 $1.52 $1.60 $6.94 $6.94 $12.21 $12.21
F Smith Office $0.26 $0.26 FC $4.00 $4.00 FC $4.38 $4.38  MD, FC $6.50 $6.50 FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $1.97 $2.07 $3.84 $4.03 ANS $2.66 $2.79 $3.75 $3.94 ANS

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION 

**

Date: 
Bid Number:
Bid Title: 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

1/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2” x 11”, Black 
vinyl, 2” 

3/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2” x 11”, Black 
vinyl, 3” 

4/ Binder, 3 Ring, 8-1/2”x11”, White 
vinyl, 1” 

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

2/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2” x 11”, Black 
vinyl, 2”

Tuesday, May 24, 2016  2:00 PM
162005
Classroom and Office Supplies

Recommended Award

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

5/Binder, 3 Ring, 8-1/2” x 11”, White 
vinyl, 1-1/2”

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

10/ Sheet Protectors
11/ Folders, Twin Pocket, Portfolio 

style, without prongs
9/ Divider Sheets

6/ Binder, 3 Ring, 8-1/2” x 11”, 2” 
White vinyl, 2''

7/ Binder, 3 Ring, 8-1/2”x11”, White 
vinyl, 3” 

**

8/ Binder, 3 Ring, 8-1/2”x11”, Blaack 
vinyl, 1/2” 

12/ Folders, with Pockets and Prongs
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.89 $1.89 $8.98 $8.98 MD $7.72 $7.72 MD $9.45 $9.45 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. No Bid No Bid $15.45 $15.45 $8.24 $8.24 $9.98 $9.98
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools No Bid No Bid $9.09 $9.09 $7.80 $7.80 $9.69 $9.69
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.91 $15.66
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid $9.00 $9.00  MD, FC $7.26 $7.26  MD, FC $9.43 $9.43  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% No Bid No Bid $8.92 $9.37 MD $7.66 $8.04 MD $9.38 $9.85 MD

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $9.45 $9.45 MD $9.45 $9.45 MD $9.45 $9.45 MD No Bid No Bid
F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $9.98 $9.98 $9.98 $9.98 $13.16 $13.16 $0.72 $0.72
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $9.69 $9.69 $9.69 $9.69 $15.95 $15.95 $0.69 $0.69
O School Specialty 5% $14.91 $15.66 $14.91 $15.66 $5.09 $5.34 A,AA No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office $9.43 $9.43  MD, FC $9.43 $9.43  MD, FC $9.43 $9.43  MD, FC $0.75 $0.75 FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $9.38 $9.85 MD $9.38 $9.85 MD $9.38 $9.85 MD $0.65 $0.68 ANS, MD

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid $5.70 $5.70 MD $4.39 $4.39 MD $2.78 $2.78 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $5.12 $5.12 $5.99 $5.99 $4.55 $4.55 $3.07 $3.07
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools No Bid No Bid $5.89 $5.89 $4.45 $4.45 $3.19 $3.19
O School Specialty 5% $73.08 $76.73 No Bid No Bid $4.19 $4.40 $5.98 $6.28 ANS

F Smith Office No Bid No Bid $5.69 $5.69  MD, FC $4.38 $4.38  MD, FC No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $6.48 $6.80 $5.32 $5.59 ANS, MD $4.05 $4.25 ANS, MD $1.95 $2.05 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $2.54 $2.54 MD $3.23 $3.23 MD $3.23 $3.23 MD $3.54 $3.54 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $2.82 $2.82 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $2.89 $2.89 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $3.09 $3.09
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $1.86 $1.95 $1.86 $1.95 $1.86 $1.95
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid $2.31 $2.31  MD, FC $2.31 $2.31  MD, FC $2.53 $2.53  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $1.84 $1.93 ANS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

13/ Folders, Twin Pocket, Plastic, 
Portfolio style, without prongs

14/ Folders, File, Manila, Legal Size 15/ Folders, File Manila, Letter Size

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

25/ Letter Size # 950 File Frames, 
Hanging

26/ Paper Manuscript Writing, (Grade 
1)

27/ Paper, Manuscript Writing, 
(Grade 2)

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

21/ Box, File Storage, Legal Size 22/ Legal Size Folders, Hanging File 23/  Letter size, Folders Hanging File

**
16/ Letter size, File Folders, Green

17/ Letter size, File Folders, Red 18/ Letter size, File Folders, Blue 19/ Letter size, File Folders, Purple
20/ File Folder, Legal Size, Expand-

able

24/ Legal Size #960 File Frames, 
Hanging 

28/ Paper, Manuscript Writing, (Grade 
3) 
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $5.12 $5.12 MD $1.88 $1.88 MD No Bid No Bid $2.68 $2.68 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $3.95 $3.95 $1.59 $1.59 No Bid No Bid $1.59 $1.59 ANS

O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $1.26 $1.32 ANS No Bid No Bid $1.07 $1.07
F Smith Office $3.66 $3.66  MD, FC $1.34 $1.34  MD, FC No Bid No Bid $2.69 $2.69  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.49 $0.49 MD $0.70 $0.70 MD $0.73 $0.73 MD $1.97 $1.97 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. No Bid No Bid $0.76 $0.76 $0.84 $0.84 $2.30 $2.30
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.59 $0.59 $0.60 $0.60 $0.68 $0.68 $1.99 $1.99
O School Specialty 5% $5.05 $5.30 $0.76 $0.80 $0.83 $0.87 $6.25 $6.56
F Smith Office $0.52 $0.52  MD, FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.00 $2.00  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.488 $0.512 MD $0.598 $0.628 $0.708 $0.743 $1.43 $1.50 A, AA

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.30 $0.30 MD $0.45 $0.45 MD $6.56 $6.56 MD 41.43/21.76 41.43/21.76 A, NS, MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.23 $0.23 $0.56 $0.56 $9.06 $9.06 $55.68 $55.68
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.25 $0.25 $0.45 $0.45 $5.83 $5.83 $40.05 $40.05
O School Specialty 5% $0.23 $0.24 $0.46 $0.48 $7.03 $7.38 A,NS $57.28 $60.14
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid $0.46 $0.46  MD, FC $5.25 $5.25  MD, FC $30.00 $30.00  A, NS,MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.184 $0.193 ANS $0.384 $0.403 $5.71 $6.00 $37.94 $39.84

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.58 $0.58 MD $4.99 $4.99 MD $6.11 $6.11 MD, 1 $2.71 $2.71 MD, 1

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.46 $0.46 $2.91 $2.91 $1.10 $1.10 $0.50 $0.50 A, NS

F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.50 $0.50 $4.79 $4.79 $3.50 $3.50 $1.50 $1.50
O School Specialty 5% $0.23 $0.24 $9.42 $9.89 A,AA $2.50 $2.63 $1.75 $1.84
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.62 $0.62  MD, FC $0.33 $0.33  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.374 $0.393 $2.42 $2.54 A, AA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NO AWARD

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

37/ Staple Remover

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

38/ Stapples

35/ Clip Board, Legal Size

29/ Paper, Manuscript Writing, Story-
Writing

30/ Sentence Strips 31/ Paper, Graph Filler 32/ Paper, Student Notebook Filler

33/ Notebook, Spiral, Single Subject 36/ Stapler 4”

39/ Mechanical Pencil Sharpener 40/ Black Electric Pencil Sharpener

41/ ¼” One-Hole paper Punch
42/ Two and Three adjustable Hole 

Punch Heavy Duty
43/  3” x 5” Plain Blue Index Cards 44/ 3” x 5” Plain White Index Cards

NO AWARD

**

**

**

**

34/ Clip Board, Letter Size
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $2.71 $2.71 MD, 1 $5.01 $5.01 MD, 1 $5.01 $5.01 MD, 1 $4.31 $4.31 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.46 $0.46 A, NS $0.74 $0.74 A, NS $0.69 $0.69 A, NS $1.06 $1.06 A, NS

F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $1.50 $1.50 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $4.60 $4.60
O School Specialty 5% $1.75 $1.84 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $4.60 $4.83
F Smith Office $0.33 $0.33  MD, FC $0.49 $0.49  MD, FC $0.49 $0.49  MD, FC $0.865 $0.865  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries 4.31 $4.31 MD No Bid No Bid $3.40 $3.40 MD $0.75 $0.75 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.11 $1.11 A, NS $2.59 $2.59 $4.06 $4.06 $0.46 $0.46
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $4.60 $4.60 No Bid No Bid $2.89 $2.89 $0.55 $0.55
O School Specialty 5% $4.60 $4.83 $1.14 $1.20 A,AA No Bid No Bid $1.25 $1.31
F Smith Office $0.865 $0.865  MD, FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.47 $2.47 $0.512 $0.512 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $2.04 $2.04 MD $0.49 $0.49 MD $2.55 $2.55 MD No Bid No Bid
F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $2.43 $2.43 $0.53 $0.53 $3.04 $3.04 $6.04 $6.04
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid $0.69 $0.69 No Bid No Bid $5.48 $5.48
F Pyramid Schools $1.46 $1.46 $0.45 $0.45 $3.09 $3.09 $5.59 $5.59
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $4.22 $4.43 $4.35 $4.57 $6.96 $7.31
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid $0.50 $0.50  MD, FC No Bid No Bid $6.00 $6.00  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $1.37 $1.44 $0.664 $0.697 MD $0.420 $0.441 ANS $5.24 $5.50 MD

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid $1.38 $1.38 MD No Bid No Bid $5.29 $5.29 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $7.96 $7.96 $1.09 $1.09 $0.57 $0.57 $7.52 $7.52
F National Art School Sup. $7.20 $7.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $7.69 $7.69 $0.92 $0.92 No Bid No Bid $5.49 $5.49
O School Specialty 5% $9.18 $9.64 $2.38 $2.50 $0.66 $0.66 No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office $7.90 $7.90  MD, FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.29 $5.29  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $6.91 $7.26 MD $0.814 $0.855 $0.20 $0.21 $5.25 $5.51 MD

49/ 5” x 8” White Ruled Index Cards
50/ Adding Machine Tape

1/4” x 150’ roll
51/ Silver Duct Tape 52/ Masking Tape ¾” x 60 yds

48/ 5” x 8” Plain White Index Cards47/ 4” x 6” White Ruled Index Cards

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

53/ Masking Tape 2” x 60 yds 54/ Frosted Mending Tape 55/Box Sealing Tape 56/ 3” X 15 Yds Book Mending Tape

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

57/ 4” X 15 Yds Book Mending Tape
58/ Heavy Duty Black Tape 

Dispensers
59/ Black Plastic Tape Dispensers

60/ 8-1/2” x 11” Pads, Legal Ruled, 
yellow

**

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

45/ 3” x 5” White Ruled Index Cards 46/ 4” x 6” Plain White Index Cards

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $6.85 $6.85 MD $0.56 $0.56 MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $10.35 $10.35 $0.59 $0.59 $3.08 $3.08 $1.73 $1.73
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.24 $3.24 $2.28 $2.28
F Pyramid Schools $7.29 $7.29 $0.65 $0.65 $3.51 $3.51 $1.96 $1.96
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.58 $3.76 $11.50 $12.08
F Smith Office $6.85 $6.85  MD, FC $0.565 $0.565  MD, FC $3.20 $3.20 FC $1.88 $1.88 FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $6.81 $7.15 MD $0.56 $0.59 MD $3.03 $3.18 ANS $2.03 $2.13 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid $1.46 $1.46 MD $1.57 $1.57 MD $1.77 $1.77 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.86 $0.86 $12.00 $12.00 $1.98 $1.98 $2.48 $2.48
F National Art School Sup. $1.15 $1.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.99 $0.99 ANS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.79 $1.79
O School Specialty 5% $4.75 $4.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.92 $2.02 ANS

F Smith Office $0.95 $0.95 FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $0.95 $1.00 ANS $1.74 $1.83 $1.08 $1.13 $1.28 $1.34

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.75 $0.75 MD $1.43 $1.43 MD $1.81 $1.81 MD $0.84 $0.84 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.99 $0.99 $1.79 $1.79 $2.13 $2.13 $0.74 $0.74
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.59 $0.59 3 $1.39 $1.39 $1.79 $1.79 $0.82 $0.82 ANS

O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $0.83 $0.87 No Bid No Bid $0.97 $1.02
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.80 $0.80  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.43 $0.45 $0.84 $0.88 ANS $1.01 $1.06 $0.594 $0.624 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.84 $0.84 MD No Bid No Bid $0.84 $0.84 MD $0.84 $0.84 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.74 $0.74 $0.91 $0.91 $0.74 $0.74 $0.74 $0.74
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.82 $0.82 ANS $0.82 $0.82 $0.82 $0.82 ANS $0.82 $0.82 ANS

O School Specialty 5% $0.97 $1.02 $0.97 $1.02 $2.27 $2.38 $2.27 $2.38
F Smith Office $0.80 $0.80  MD, FC $0.91 $0.91 $0.80 $0.80  MD, FC $0.80 $0.80  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.594 $0.624 ANS $0.594 $0.624 ANS $0.594 $0.624 ANS $0.594 $0.624 ANS

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

61/ 8-1/2” x 14” Pads, Legal Ruled, 
Yellow

62/ Green tinted narrow ruled 
Stenographer Pads

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

65/ 1-1/2” x 2” Sticky Notes,
Canary Yellow

66/ 6" Plastic Rulers 67/ 12" Plastic Rulers

**
64/ 3” x 3” Sticky Notes, Canary

Yellow

68/ 12" Wood w/metal edge Rulers

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

69/ 18" Wooden w/metal edge Rulers
70/ Meter Stick, Wood, 39” w/metal

tip
71/ 6" Plastic Protractor 2 row 

calibrations
72/ Black Ball Point Pens w/clip cap

63/ 3” x 5” Sticky Notes, Canary
Yellow

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

73/Blue Ball Point Pens w/clip cap 74/ Red Ball Point Pens w/clip cap
75/ Black Medium Ball Point Pens 

w/clip cap
76/ Blue Medium Ball Point Pens 

w/clip cap
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.84 $0.84 MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.84 $0.84 $2.67 $2.67 $3.36 $3.36 $3.36 $3.36
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.82 $0.82 ANS $3.59 $3.59 $3.59 $3.59 $3.59 $3.59
O School Specialty 5% $2.27 $2.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office $0.80 $0.80  MD, FC $3.36 $3.36  MD, FC $3.36 $3.36  MD, FC $3.36 $3.36  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.59 $0.62 ANS $2.02 $2.12 $2.02 $2.12 $2.02 $2.12 A

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid $2.45 $2.45 MD No Bid No Bid $0.85 $0.85 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $7.44 $7.44 $2.59 $2.59 No Bid No Bid $0.52 $0.52
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $6.99 $6.99 No Bid No Bid $0.50 $0.50 $0.95 $0.95
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $2.46 $2.58 No Bid No Bid $1.363 $1.431
F Smith Office $5.76 $5.76  MD, FC $2.25 $2.25 MD,FC No Bid No Bid $1.20 $1.20  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $7.67 $8.05 No Bid No Bid $0.47 $0.49 $0.45 $0.47 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.15 $1.15 MD $0.57 $0.57 MD $1.40 $1.40 MD $1.64 $1.64 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.39 $1.39 4.79 $4.79 $2.67 $2.67 $2.55 $2.55
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $1.15 $1.15 $3.42 $3.42 $1.38 $1.38 $1.62 $1.62
O School Specialty 5% $1.34 $1.41 $4.86 $5.10 $3.08 $3.23 $2.94 $3.09
F Smith Office $1.40 $1.40  MD, FC $0.56 $0.56  MD, FC $1.38 $1.38  MD, FC $1.62 $1.62  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.48 $0.50 A, AA $3.19 $3.35 MD $1.32 $1.39 $1.46 $1.53 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.91 $0.91 MD No Bid No Bid $2.94 $2.94 MD No Bid No Bid
F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.39 $1.39 $1.19 $1.19 $2.91 $2.91 $5.52 $5.52
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid $1.34 $1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.72 $0.72 $1.10 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.04 $1.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office $0.90 $0.90  MD, FC $0.94 $0.94  MD, FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $0.71 $0.75 $1.10 $1.16 $1.34 $1.41 $0.19 $0.20

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

77/ Red Medium Ball Point Pens 
w/clip cap

78/ Black Uni-Ball Pens fine point 0.7 
mm

79/ Blue Uni-Ball Pens fine point 0.7 
mm

80/ Red Uni-Ball Pens fine point 0.7 
mm

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

81/ Green Uni-Ball Pens fine point 
0.7 mm

82/ 0.6 oz White Correction Fluid
83/  ¾ oz White Photocopy 

Correction Fluid
84/ White Out Correction Tape

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

85/ White Out Correction Pen 86/ Tipped #2 Pencils 87/ Untipped Beginners Pencils 88/ 2nd Grade Pencils w/erasers

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

89/ Pencils, #2-1/2 Lead 90/ Pencil, #2-1/2 Lead 91/ Pencils, Mechanical,.5mm lead 92/ Lead, Refill, .5 mm
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.07 $1.07 MD $2.44 $2.44 MD $2.44 $2.44 MD, SNA $2.44 $2.44 MD, SNA

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $2.22 $2.22 $0.55 $0.55 $6.96 $6.96 $6.96 $6.96
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.37 $5.37 $5.37 $5.37
F Pyramid Schools $0.84 $0.84 $0.49 $0.49 $4.95 $4.95 $4.95 $4.95
O School Specialty 5% $4.86 $5.10 A,NS No Bid No Bid $7.47 $7.84 $7.47 $7.84
F Smith Office $1.07 $1.07  MD, FC No Bid No Bid $2.41 $2.41 MD, FC,SNA $2.41 $2.41  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $0.52 $0.55 $0.075 $0.079 ANS $2.29 $2.40 $2.29 $2.40 MD, SNA

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $2.44 $2.44 MD, SNA $2.44 $2.44 MD, SNA $5.35 $5.35 MD 3.91/1.19 3.91/1.19 MD/ MD, SNA

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $6.92 $6.92 $6.96 $6.96 $7.44 $7.44 $4.17 $4.17
F National Art School Sup. $5.37 $5.37 $5.37 $5.37 $6.00 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $4.95 $4.95 $4.95 $4.95 $4.99 $4.99 $1.09 $1.09
O School Specialty 5% $7.47 $7.84 $7.47 $7.84 $7.89 $8.28 $4.43 $4.65
F Smith Office $2.41 $2.41  MD, FC $2.41 $2.41  MD, FC $1.90 $1.90 $1.00 $1.00  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $2.29 $2.40 MD, SNA $2.29 $2.40 MD, SNA $1.30 $1.37 A,SNA $0.73 $0.77 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.91 $0.91 MD $1.16 $1.16 MD $2.65 $2.65 MD $2.65 $2.65 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.19 $1.19 $2.89 $2.89 $3.39 $3.39 $3.39 $3.39
F National Art School Sup. $2.40 $2.40 $2.30 $2.30 $7.80 $7.80 $7.80 $7.80
F Pyramid Schools $0.99 $0.99 $1.19 $1.19 $2.84 $2.84 $2.84 $2.84
O School Specialty 5% $3.47 $3.64 $3.10 $3.26 $0.93 $0.98 $11.21 $11.77
F Smith Office $0.92 $0.92  MD, FC $1.14 $1.14  MD, FC $2.65 $2.65  MD, FC $2.65 $2.65  MD, FC

O Standard Stationary 5% $1.08 $1.13 MD $1.08 $1.13 MD $3.08 $3.23 MD, SNA $3.08 $3.23 MD

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $9.71 $9.71 MD $1.73 $1.73 MD $1.58 $1.58 MD $1.96 $1.96 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $12.70 $12.70 $2.15 $2.15 $4.80 $4.80 $2.56 $2.56
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid $1.70 $1.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $8.49 $8.49 $1.69 $1.69 $1.69 $1.69 $2.19 $2.19
O School Specialty 5% $0.46 $0.48 $2.31 $2.43 $5.50 $5.78 $2.74 $2.88
F Smith Office $9.66 $9.66  MD, FC $1.69 $1.69  MD, FC $1.57 $1.57  MD, FC No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $3.11 $3.27 $0.97 $1.02 A, SNA $1.27 $1.33 ANS $0.73 $0.77 ANS

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

93/Erasers, Pencil, Pink Pearl, Large
94/Erasers, Caps, fits standard 

pencils
95/Black Markers, fine point, 

Permanent,
96/Blue Markers, fine point, 

Permanent, 

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

105/Erasers, Multi-Purpose, for
chalk boards and white boards

106/Cleaner for Dry White Board, 8 oz. 107/Highlighter, Yellow, chisel tip. 108/ Highlighter Set, 6 pens per set

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

 97/Red Markers, fine point, 
Permanent,

98/Green Markers, fine point, 
Permanent,

99/Markers, Black, large, felt, chisel- 
tip,

100/Marker Set, felt-tip, chisel or 
bullet,

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

101/ Markers, Dry Erasable, Chisel 
Point, for White Board

102/Markers, Dry Erasable, Fine Point, 
for White Board

103/Black Markers, Dry Erasable for 
White Board.

104/Blue Markers, Dry Erasable for 
White Board.
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.06 $5.06 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. No Bid No Bid $1.19 $1.19 $1.17 $1.17 $5.99 $5.99
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools No Bid No Bid $1.39 $1.39 $1.09 $1.09 $4.29 $4.29
O School Specialty 5% $15.80 $16.59 4 $1.37 $1.44 $1.14 $1.20 $3.36 $3.53 ANS

F Smith Office $13.20 $13.20  MD, FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% No Bid No Bid $2.18 $2.29 A, NS $1.09 $1.14 $3.16 $3.32

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.28 $1.28 MD $3.75 $3.75 MD $0.73 $0.73 MD $3.56 $3.56 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.23 $1.23 $3.68 $3.68 $0.96 $0.96 4 $4.69 $23.45
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $1.90 $1.90 $4.00 $4.00 $0.72 $0.72 $3.60 $3.60
O School Specialty 5% $1.60 $1.68 $4.90 $5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $1.27 $1.33 MD $3.75 $3.94 MD $0.48 $0.50 A, ANS $2.19 $2.30 ANS

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.18 $0.18 MD $0.45 $0.45 MD $1.11 $1.11 MD $1.34 $1.34 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.18 $0.18 $0.50 $0.50 $1.36 $1.36 $1.57 $1.57
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.20 $0.20 $0.40 $0.40 $1.00 $1.00 $1.69 $1.69
O School Specialty 5% $0.19 $0.20 ANS $0.38 $0.40 $0.93 $0.98 No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $0.116 $0.122 $0.377 $0.396 ANS $0.97 $1.02 $0.86 $0.90

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.40 $1.40 MD $0.53 $0.53 MD $0.88 $0.88 MD $0.74 $0.74 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $1.73 $1.73 $0.68 $0.68 $1.04 $1.04 $0.97 $0.97
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $1.40 $1.40 $0.50 $0.50 $0.69 $0.69 $0.79 $0.79
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $0.51 $0.54 ANS $0.72 $0.76 No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $0.88 $0.92 $0.47 $0.49 $0.46 $0.48 ANS $0.51 $0.54 ANS

123/Rubber Bands 3”x 1/16”x 1/32” 
thick

**

**

**

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

117/Binder Clips, Small, Black/
Silver, Size #2, ¾” wide

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

118/Binder Clips, Black/Silver,
Medium, Size #5, 1-1/4” wide, 5/8”

119/Binder Clips, Large, Black/
Silver, Size #10, 2” wide

120/Fasteners, Paper, complete 
w/base and top, 2-3/4”

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

121/Brass #5 Fasteners 1-1/4” Shank 122/Brass #2 Fasteners 1/2” Shank
124/Black Pads, Foam Rubber, 2-3/4” 

x 4- 1/4”

109/Marker, Counter feit Money
Detector

110/ 1oz Finger Moistener in Plastic 
Container

111/Rubber Cement, 4 oz. Bottle 
w/brush cap

112/Book Ring, 1-1/2”

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

113/Paper Clips, Gem, Standard #1, 
nonrust

114/Paper Clips, Gem, Jumbo 115/1-1/4” Paper Clips, Bull Dog 116/3” Paper Clips, Bull Dog

NO AWARD
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.74 $0.74 MD $0.27 $0.27 MD No Bid No Bid $9.57 $9.57 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $0.97 $0.97 $0.33 $0.33 $2.50 $2.50 $13.27 $13.27
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $0.79 $0.79 $0.28 $0.28 $1.95 $1.95 $8.99 $8.99
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $0.62 $0.65 ANS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $0.51 $0.54 ANS $0.14 $0.15 No Bid No Bid $5.84 $6.13

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.85 $0.85 MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $12.22 $12.22 $5.14 $5.14 $1.50 $1.50 $11.00 $11.00 5

F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $19.95 $19.95 $4.39 $4.39 $1.95 $1.95 No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $48.81 $51.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.84 $20.83
F Smith Office $13.00 $13.00 FC $5.39 $5.39 FC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% $12.20 $12.81 MD $3.89 $4.08 $0.67 $0.70 A,AA No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $3.69 $3.69 MD No Bid No Bid $1.73 $1.73 MD

F Gulf Cost Office Prod. $3.65 $3.65 No Bid No Bid $2.50 $2.50
F National Art School Sup. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid Schools $5.49 $5.49 No Bid No Bid $2.95 $2.95
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationary 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

A      Alternate bid
AA    Alternate Accepted

NS    No Sample
SNA  Sample Not Accepted
MQ   Minimum order
MD   Minimum dollar
FC    Full Case

1  Packadged by 10 packs of 100
2 Must buy 18 in a carton
3 Sold by Dozon
4 Sold only by 3 dozen in a pack
5 Sold in quantities of 50

ANS  Alternate not accepted

**

**

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

129/Labels, Address, 1” x 2-5/8”, 
White, E-Z Peel

130/Labels, Mailing/Shipping, 2” x 4”, 
White

NO AWARD

126/Thumb Tacks, 3/8”

131/Name Badge, Red
border & White middle & w/Hello

132/Badge, Plastic w/Clip or Clip/Pin, 
3-1/2” x 2-1/4”

FL. 
Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

133/Picture Frame, Black, 8-1/2” x 
11”

134/Document/Certificate Frame, 
Black Plastic, 8-1/2” x 11”

135/Project/Display Boards, 36” x 
48”, TriFold, White

127/White Plastic Hook Meduim Duty 128/Black Wall Clock 14" face Battery
FL. 

Pref. 
Adj. 
5%

125/Red Pads, Stamp, Foam Rubber, 
2-3/4” x 4-1/4”**
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website 
address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid 
tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and 
Florida Law.

John Dombroskie,
Director Purchasing Department
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